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Farm Safety & Ag Education
2627 KFB Plaza

Manhattan, KS  66503
 (785) 587-6150 

Recent statistics indicate that 
agriculture is the second most 
dangerous industry in the United 
States.

Are people aware that dangers 
on the farm include anything 	
from machinery and chemicals 
to severe weather, livestock and 
on-farm structures?

One of the largest obstacles in 
promoting farm safety is the “it 
won’t happen to me” attitude.
	
Do we want young people to 	
be ignorant about farm safety 
and engage in behaviors that 
may lead to injury or even 
death?

Rollover Protective Structure 
(ROPS) and seatbelt-equipped 
tractors can save approximately 
350 lives in the United States 
each year.

Are adults and youth alike being 
educated properly about correct 
usage of farm safety equipment?
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